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Glenn Berry

From: Luke Troiani
Sent: Friday, 19 August 2016 1:29 PM
To: Glenn Berry
Subject: Re: 1412 Coburg Nth - final report

Hi Glenn, 

Thank you so much for all of your work, everything you have done has been of excellent quality 
and extremely professional.

If any of my family or friends are in a similar spot of bother i will not hesitate to recommend your business.

Kind Regards, 
Luke Troiani 

Director of Avia Performance 
1/10 Dairy Drive, Coburg North, VIC 3085 

M: 0407 544 ***
E: ****@aviaperformance.com.au
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Atma Environmental 

56 William Street, ABBOTSFORD, Vic 3067 Australia 

Tel: +61-3-9429 6955   Fax: +61-3-9429 5911   Mob: +61-412 000 445 

Email: gberry@atmaenvironmental.comWeb:www.atmaenvironmental.com 

     

Please consider the environment before printing this email. 

  

  

  

From: Luke Troiani [mailto:luke@aviaperformance.com.au]  
Sent: Thursday, 18 August 2016 5:18 PM 
To: Glenn Berry <gberry@atmaenvironmental.com> 
Subject: Fwd: You've been sent the details of a NetBank transfer 

  

Hi Glenn, 

  

Thanks for coming out today, appreciate all of your work and looking forward to getting the report. 

  

I have paid the invoice and sent the remittance to the office email and forward it in this email. 

  

 
 

Kind Regards, 

Luke Troiani 

  

Director of Avia Performance 

1/10 Dairy Drive, Coburg North, VIC 3085 

  

M: 0407 544 794 

E: luke@aviaperformance.com.au  



3

  

 

  

---------- Forwarded message ---------- 
From: <Notification@cba.com.au> 
Date: Thu, Aug 18, 2016 at 5:13 PM 
Subject: You've been sent the details of a NetBank transfer 
To: luke@aviaperformance.com.au 
 
 
Hello, 
 
We've been asked to send you the following NetBank transfer details. 
 
Message: 
 
Date: 18/08/2016 
 Time: 5:12pm Sydney/Melbourne time 
 
Receipt#: N081863718824 
 Transfer from: LUKE TROIANI 
 To account: BSB: 063-217 
 Account number: *****013 
 Amount transferred: $2024.00 
 Description: inv 611 avia 
 
 
The money has been sent, but we are not able to confirm that the payment has been received. We do not 
take responsibility for any information provided in the 'Message' and/or 'Description' fields. 
 
Yours sincerely, 
Commonwealth Bank of Australia, AFSL and Australian credit licence 234945 
 
Please do not reply. 
Message: 1560585191 

  

 


